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Faced with grotesque
inequality, what can
we learn from Chile?

“Chile was the birthplace of
neoliberalism, and it shall also be
its grave!” said Gabriel Boric, a
young student leader from the
radical fold who was forged in the
protests that has rocked Chile in
recent years. The Chileans just
elected him as their president in
what was the most acrimonious
and polarised election in decades.
It was a contest between the
legacies of the left-liberal Salvador
Allende and that of General
Pinnochet. Read more.

The Fate of Rural and
Farm Credit with
Privatisation of Banks


Rural and farm credit were totally
neglected before the
nationalisation of banks on
19th July 1969. The historic All
India Rural Credit Survey carried
out in 1954 showed that formal
credit institutions provided less
than 9% of credit needs in India.
While, the moneylenders, traders
and the rich landlords handled
more than 75% of rural credit. 
Read more.

Podcast: Free Trade
Agreements- A
Balance Sheet with
Shalini Bhutani


Check out the latest episode of
'You, Me and the Economy' with
Shalini Bhutani speaking about
Free Trade Agreements: A
Balance Sheet. Listen here.
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